
W.R. GRAHAM EXPIRES AFTER LONG ILLNESS


It is with profound regret that we chronicle the death of Mr. William R. 
Graham, which occurred at his home, about a mile east of this town, at 1 
o’clock January 28th. He had been in declining health for some time, and 
having consulted well known specialists without finding relief, he, at the 
advice of his family physician Dr. Clagett, went to Garfield Hospital in 
Washington, where an operation was performed on him on the 21st of 
last April for cancer of the stomach. The disease had made such ravages 
that the surgeons could afford only a temporary betterment of his 
condition.


Mr. Graham was a native of Tazewell county and was in the 60th year of 
his age. On coming to Loudoun some 10 or 12 years ago he purchased 
the home farm of the late Chas. C. Mercier (one of the best in this 
section) upon which he had since resided. Later he purchased the Posey 
farm near Waterford, and was extensively engaged in stock raising and 
agricultural pursuits. He was a man of fine judgment, great energy and 
will power, and possessed a well cultivated mind that had been stored 
with a fund of practical information.


He was for a number of years a member of the Presbyterian Church, and 
also a member of Hamilton Lodge A. F. & A. M.


Before leaving Tazewell Mr Graham was for a term or more deputy clerk 
of the County Court.


He is survived by his wife and eight children - Charles, Samuel and Wade 
and Misses Mary, Annie, Ollie, Ossie and Margaret Lee Graham.


His funeral took place from his late home. Rev. J.M. Holiday assisted by 
Rev Mr. Fettsler officiating. The burial was in the family lot in Lakeview 
Cemetery, the ceremonies at the grave being conducted by Hamilton 
Lodge of Masons.


